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Dear colleagues. 

Reference is made to your letters dated 25 June 2013 and 23 September 2013 entitled 'Social 
Security system for the Local Agents in Delegations', The delay in sending this reply is 
sincerely regretted. The HEAS and the Commission value the important work which local 
agents contribute towards achieving the objectives pursued by its Delegations. They indeed 
constitute an essential category of staff. 

A system of social security comprising a 'Provident Fund' and a 'Complementary Sickness 
Insurance' (CS1SLA) was created in 1996; these schemes were set up in recognition of the 
fact that the local market employment conditions sometimes result in insufficient or non­
existent social protection. These schemes provide complementary cover when the local 
system is considered insufficient or primary cover when the local system does not exist. 

At the time of the creation of these two schemes. Article 14 of the Framework rales laying 
down the conditions of employment of local staff already called for their setting up, however, 
Article 121 of the Conditions of employment of other servants (CEOS) did not provide a 
sufficiently clear legal basis. This is the reason why Article 121 CEOS was amended in 2010 
although, in fact, the schemes to implement this Article were already in existence at the time. 

Article 121 CEOS requires the implementation of EU social security schemes only "where 
coverage by the local system either does not exist or is insufficient". The Eli has so far 
applied these complementary schemes in as many as 134 out of a total of 141 delegations. It is 
therefore clear that the EU has already implemented Article 121 CEÖS by ensuring a very 
wide coverage of the social rights of local agents in Delegations. 
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The time is right to engage in social dialogue on loca! agent issues in the forum of the HEAS 
Social Dialogue meetings held for this purpose, where further clarification on the 
implementation of Article 121 CEOS can be provided and broader issues relating to local 
agents in Delegations can be discussed. 

Yours sincerely, 

Catherine Ashton Maroš Seßovic 


